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Special Revocable Permits 
The Colorado State Patrol Port of Entry Branch Special Revocable 

Permit (SRP) Program supports safe and efficient commercial vehicle 

commerce within the state by issuing permits to qualified operators 
and companies.  Operators and drivers may apply for an SRP to 

reduce the number of times required to clear a Port of Entry facility 

when the regularly operated route is within five miles but not does not 
pass a Port of Entry directory. Eligible applicants may receive a permit 

and comply with the conditions of the SRP program. 

 

1) What is an SRP? 

An SRP is a permit issued by the Colorado State Patrol Port of Entry 
Branch.  §42-8-105 (4), CRS, allows the Port of Entry to issue an SRP to 
the owner or operator of any vehicle being operated over a regularly 
scheduled route.   

2) Who is eligible to apply for an SRP? 

Any owner operator of a commercial vehicle required to record a 
clearance under §42-8-105, CRS, who also is traveling a regular route 

and meets the eligibility requirements to participate in the SRP Program 

3) Who is eligible to receive an SRP? 

Specific eligibility requirements are provided in detail within the Port of 
Entry Size and Weight Rules, 8 CCR 1507-28.  Summarized, to be eligible 
to receive an SRP, applicants must not have a significant history of 
violations of size and weight laws, clearance requirements or commercial 

vehicle safety regulations.   

4) What is the primary benefit of an SRP? 

An SRP allows for a vehicle that would otherwise be required to clear a 
Port of Entry facility by §42-8-105, CRS, to not do so. 

5) Does a holder of an SRP never have to clear a POE facility or weight 
operation? 

An SRP is issued for specific vehicles operated by a carrier and identifies 
a specific, fixed, Port of Entry facility.  A holder of an SRP must record 
clearances quarterly with the vehicles assigned to the SRP at the facility 
the permit is issued for.  The holder of an SRP must clear those port of 
entry facilities not indicated on a permit and to comply with direction to 
clear mobile Port of Entry weight operations where encountered. 

6) How long are SRPs good for? 

The Port of Entry is able to issue an SRP for a period up to three years. 
Standard SRPs may be issued for three years; Probationary SRPs are 
typically good for one year. 

7) How do I apply for an SRP? 

Applications can be submitted online using the CDOT COOPR portal, 
downloaded from the Colorado State Patrol Port of Entry Branch 
webpage or personally requested by calling either the Colorado State 
Patrol Port of Entry at 303-273-1870 or the SRP Program Coordinator at 
303-273-1864.   

8) How long does it take to get an SRP? 

SRP applications may up to 21 days to process.  Most applications can be 

processed in 7 to 10 business days. 
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